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Andrew Winn To: Stephen.Dilley _ _ GRO
04112,200611:32 cc: <martyn.mitchelI; GRO _ } <mandytalbot@i_._,_.--_-~Ro_._

"Tom Beezer";._. -- I, "Richard Morgan" 
<rmorgan@C;-:_:_:_:_:_:-:=_ GRO :=:=:  "Thomas Bourne" 
<Thomas.Boume@ _,___ _ GRO ____•___j "Adrian Bratt" 
<adrian.bratt@ ._ _._._GRO_._

Subject: Re: VERY URGENT: Castleton's wages - P.O -v- Castleton 

Stephen 

HR did not have any documentary support for Castleton's wages as pay is by BRCS. Janice has 
produced a schedule of payments below which I hope will help. 

I am not in the office Tuesday but any urgent issues I will be picking up voicema'Is on GRO ' 

regards 

Andy Winn 

Branch Improvement & Liaison 
Post Office Ltd 
Finance 

Postline: GRO ;STD Phone: GRO ;Fax:; GRO Mobile: GRO 
External Email: 
----- Forwarded by Andrew Winn/e/POSTOFFICE on 04112/2006 11:28 -----

Janice Thompson To: Andrew Winn/e1POSTOFFICE GRO 

04/1212006 10:55 cc: 
,~...... Subject: Re: VERY URGENT: Castleton's wages - P.0 -v- Castleton ] 

Andy 

Schedule of payments fro Mr Castleton 

Mr Lee Castieton.doc 

Regards 
Janice 
STL Pay Processing 
P & OD Services 
POSC 
Capstan House 
35 Broadway 
Salford 
M50 2PB 

GRO 
Pi 5336 7236 
Andrew Winn 

Andrew Winn To: Janice Thompson/e/POSTOFFICE 1 r RO 

04/12/2006 09:34 °0' ._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._.. 



POL00073761 
POL00073761 

Subject: VERY URGENT: Castleton's wages - P.O -v- Castleton 

Janice 

As discussed. Will call at 9.50. 

Andy 
Forwarded by Andrew Winn/e/POSTOFFICE on 04/12/2006 09:33 ----

"Stephen Dilley" To: <andrew.winn ._ 
cRo'_._._._. 

-
<Stephen_Dilley@IGRo1 cc. <martyn mitche!Ic GRO -__._s <mandy.talbot@; CRC _._._ -

~  GRO._._._ ._. "Tom Beezer" @ <Tom.Beezer GRO ._._._._._._._._._._._._._.__._. "Richard Morgan" 

04/12/2006 08:43 <rmorgan@r; -oRo ;, "Thomas Bourne" 
<Thomas.Bourn6t,I' :. ... ......>, "Adrian Bratt" 
<adrian.bract@':  uGROm ,,. 

Subject: VERY URGENT: Castleton's wages - P.O -v- Castleton 

Dear Andrew, 

We are going to trial cn this case tomorrow. 

Please could you email to me (copying in the others to this email) any 
documents that show how much Mr Castleton was paid plus a schedule of 
payments? Janice Thompson may be able to assist. 

I look forward to hearing from you as soon as possible, ideally today. 

Kind regards. 

Stephen Dilley 
Solicitor 
for and on behalf of Bond Pearce LLP 
DDI: I-------------•--------CRo;_._--_._.—.~- --- •-•--•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•; 
Main offi p ce : _one_• _1.44 GRO 
Fax: +44 GRO 
www.hondpearce.com 

-----Original Message-----
From: andrew.Winn@ _ _-___-___-_'_; [mailto:andrew.winn@ GRO ij 
Sent: 10 November 2006 09:16 
To: Stephen Dilley _______ _______ 

m rnCc: artyn. itchell@='II='= '2R° _ -:; mandy.talbot~ GRO Tom Beezer 
Subject: Castleton's wages - P.O -v- Castleton 

Stephen 

Responses below in relation to pay levels Mr Castleton had been generating. 
To clarify Mr Castleton was suspended on 23rd March 04 so was paid during 
January, February & March. He was not paid following suspension so I would 
assume his claim would relate to April, May & June 04. 

Hope this is adequate information. 

Andy Winn 

Branch Improvement & Liaison 
Post Office Ltd 
Finance 

/'► 
Postline _ GRO STD Phone : ; GRO_._._._._._. Fax GRO ;Mobile: ...._.-:--- .......:_......._, _._._._._._._._._., 

GRO_._._._._._._._._P External Email: andrew.winn@I GRO 
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----- Forwarded by Andrew Winn/e/POSTOFFICE on 10/11/2006 09:11 -----

Janice Thompson 
To: Andrew 

Winn/e/POSTOFICE@, GRO _ 

20/11/2006 08:58 cc: 
Subject: Castleton's wages -

P.0 -v- Castleton 

Andrew 

Re the ques:ions from the solicitor. 

1. Mr Castleton was not paid £3750.00 per month. His pay is related to the 
transactions over the counter. For the 7 full monts he was paid his total 

e-:rnirgs were £23346.47, I have egnored the 2 part months, so an average 
w: uld be £3335.21. 
L'-ir_ng his short time at the office his lowest gross pay was £3012.21 and the 
highest £3732.37 

2. The actual payment dates in 2004 were. 
Friday 30th January 
Friday 27th February 
Wednesday 31st March 

3. I would not say his loss of income was £11250.00. 
If we were asked to calculate a payment it would be 3x £3335.21 _ £lC005.63 

Hope this helps 

Regards 

Janice 
STL Pay Processing 
P & OD Services 
POSC Salford M50 2PB 
_ ........ qTq ..._._....r 

----- Forwarded by Jan-ce Thompson/e/POSTOFFICE on 10/11/2006 08:45 ----

Hector Campbell 
To: Janice 

Thompson/e/POSTOFFICE@;._, _ _cRo 
09/11/ 006 12:51 cc: 

Subject: Castleton's wages -

P.0 -v- Castleton 

Service Manager 
Recognition, Reward and Learning 
P&OD Services 
Capstan House 
35 Broadway 
Salford Quays 
M50 2PB 

Tel: GRO 

----- Forwarded by Hector Campbell/e/POSTOFFICE on 09/11/2006 12:52. -----
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Andrew Winn 
To: Hector 

Campbell/e/POSTOFFICF@ ,_ O_,-•-•-, 

09/11/2006 12:45 cc: 
Subject: Castleton's wages 

P.O -v- Castleton 
I 

Hector 

I wonder if you could :help me. We have  aleaal case ongoin_q regarding Mr Lee _., 
Castleton, formerly subpostmaster of Not sure if this is personal address 
Fad 213337. `.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.---.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-

The solicitor's questions are below and are quite straightforward. 

Sorry but as usual this is quite urgent. Would it be possible to produce 
something by the end of the week or point me in the direction of someone 
better able to assist. 

Many thanks 

Andy Winn 

Branch Improvement & Liaison 
Post Office Ltd 
Finance 

Post].ine: ._._ GRO , STD Phone:  - GRO Fax i_._._._.GRO Mobile: GRO 
-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-•-  

GRo Extenal Email andrew wi 
r_._._._._._._._._._._:.:.:.:.:_._._._._._._._._._._._._._._.' i.-.-.-.-.-.-.-.-. 

• _._.__•_•_.__•_.__; r : . nn@i GRO 

----- Forwarded by Andrew Winn/e/POSTOFFICE on 09/11/2006 12:37 -----

"Stephen Dilley" 
_ <Stephen.Dilley@r GRO To: 

<andrew. winn@i GRO •-•-•-•-•-•-
_._._. 

cc: 

<mart n.mitchel' @- - `--Uaa---_.-__- -" <wand . talboc@ _ aR6 "Tom Beezer" 
<Tom.Beezer@ ̀ •- •_._.~_._._._.

GRO

09/11/2006 11:26 Subject: Castleton's wages 
- P.O -v- Castleton 

Dear Andrew, 

I refer to our telephone conversation this morning. 

As discussed, Mr Castleton has now reduced his counterclaim from not exceeding 
£250,000 to 3 months loss of income as a subpostmaster i_e. 
£3,750 x3 = £11,250 (on the basis that the P.O could terminate his contract 
for any reason on 3 months notice). 

The Court has ordered the P.O to put in a Reply to the Amended. Counterclaim by 
no later than Monday 13 November 2006 and we are gathering relevant 
information. Please could you find out from personnel: 

1. Was Castleton paid £3,750 per month?<?xml:namespace prefix = o ns = 
"urn:schemas-microsofu-com:office:office" /> 
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2. If so, when was he paid for January, February and March 2004? 
3. Is it correct that his loss of income would be £3,750 x3 - £11,250? 

I look forward to hearing from you as soon as possible. 

Kind regards. 

Stephen Dilley 
Solicitor 
for and on behalf of Bond Pearce LLP 
DUI: GRO 
Main offi ce phone _ +44 GRO 
Fax:  G RO - -- 

----------------- ------- - --- - --- - - -
www.bondlJearce.com 

The information in this e-mail and anv attachments are confiden ial and may be 
legally privileged and protected by law. The intended recipient only is 
authorised to access this e-mail and any attachments. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please notify the sender as soon as possible and delete 
any copies. Unauthorised use, dissemination, distribution, publication or 
copying of this communication is prohibited. 

Any files attached to this e-mail will have been checked by us with virus 
detection software before transmission. You should carry out your own virus 
checks before opening any attachment. Bond Pearce LLP accepts no liability for 
any loss or damage which may be caused by software viruses. 

Bond Pearce LLP is a Limited Liability Partnership registered in England and 
Wales number 00311430. 
Registered Office: 3 Temple Quay, Temple Back East, Bristol, BSI 6DZ. 
A list of Members is available from our registered office. Any reference to a 
Partner in relation to Bond Pearce LLP means a Member of Bond Pearce LLP. 
Bond Pearce LLP is regulated by the Law Society. 

****r--k****.4, k* k*i-****-***ic***x*i:

This email and any attachments are confidential and intended for the addressee 
only. If you are not the named recipient, you must not use, disclose, 
reproduce, copy or distribute the contents of this communication. 

If you have received this in error, please contact the sender and then delete 
this email from your system. 
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The information in this e-mail and any attachments are confidential and may be 
legally privileged and protected by law. The intended recipient only is 
authorised to access this e-mail and any attachments. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please notify the sender as soon as possible and delete 
any copies. Unauthorised use, dissemination, distribution, publication or 
copying of this communication is prohibited. 

Any files attached to this e-mail will have been checked by us with virus 
detection software before transmission. You should carry out your own virus 
cheeks before opening any attachment. Bond Pearce LLP accepts no liability for 
any loss or damage which may be caused by software viruses. 

Bond Pearce LLP is a Limited Liability Partnership registered in England and 
Wales number 0C311430. 
Registered Office: 3 Temple Quay, Temple Back East, Bristol, BSl 6DZ. 
A list of Members is available from our registered office. Any reference to a 
Partner in relation to Bond Pearce LLP means a Member. of Bond Pearce LLP. Bond 
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Pearce LLP is regulated by the Law Society. 


