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From: Parsons, Andrew;._._._._.__._._._.-- - cRo- ---------------------------------
Sent: Mon 09/12/2013 1:03:32 PM (UTC) 

To: Belinda Crowe! . GRO , Chris _._._._._._ ._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._._.__. ._._.. 
Aujard G RO 

Cc: Claire Parmenter ._. GRO 

Subject: Second Sight Engagement Letter [BD-4A.FID20472253] 

Attachment: _DOC_27882026(3)_Second Sight Engagement Letter.DOCX 

Attachment: _DO C_27882026(1)_Second Sight Engagement Letter.DOC 

Belinda 

Please find attached an updated engagement letter that addresses your comments. I've slightly re-jigged the letter to put all the 
definitions at the top of the letter rather than scattering them throughout the document. 

You posed a question at (the old clause) 5.3 about whether that clause applies to both written and other forms of information - I 
confirm that it applies to information in all formats (including know-how in a person's head). 

I've also given POL a right to terminate the appointment - see 4.2. 

The fee schedule is still blank at the moment. I've attached the first version of the letter which had a few options for the fee structure 
with SS. Do you wish to consider using any of these or would you prefer to go with a simple time-cost model? 

Kind regards 
Andy 

Andrew Parsons 
Senior Associate 
for and on behalf of Bond Dickinson LLP 
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Follow Bond Dickinson: 

www.bonddickinson.com 

-----Original Message-----
From: Belinda Crowe[ "" b TjI
Sent: 07 December 2013 19:27 
To: Chris Aujard; Parsons, Andrew 
Subject: _DOC 27882026(2)_Second Sight Engagement Letter 

With many thanks to Andy for this draft. It looks to nail things down very tightly. 

A have a few comments. 

My first point relates to the first paragraph. Are we really appointing on behalf of the WG? It occurs to me that if that is the case it 
might consider it has a say in the contract. Should it be Post Office is appointing to provide services to the WG? 

I have made a few other comments/suggestions in track changes (if they appear clumsily done, it is because an iPad is not great for 
tracking. 

I will follow with a copy of the latest invoice which sets out the hourly rate for the fees schedule. 

I also notice that there is nothing about the point at which the contract terminates. Would it be possible to include something to the 
effect that the contract/role ends when the final case has been determined by the Working Group in relation to whether it is 
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appropriate for mediation. A thought I had is that in other standard contract we couch this in terms of deliverables - that may not be 
appropriate for this. 

I would be keen to get this out asap as I am sure we will need to discuss and I would like to make sure we do this before SS 
completes its first report. Ideally we should get thhis to them mid-week. 

This email and any attachments are confidential and intended for the addressee only. If you are not the named recipient, you must 
not use, disclose, reproduce, copy or distribute the contents of this communication. If you have received this in error, please contact 
the sender by reply email and then delete this email from your system. Any views or opinions expressed within this email are solely 
those of the sender, unless otherwise specifically stated. 

POST OFFICE LIMITED is registered in England and Wales no 2154540. Registered Office: 148 OLD STREET, LONDON EC 1 V 
9HQ. 
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<p> 
<font color="#666666" size=" 1"> 
The information iii __ this__ e-mail and any attachments is confidential and may be legally privileged and protected by law. 
christopher.aujard( _ _CRo_ only is authorised to access this a-mail and any attachments. If you are not 
christopher.aujard- "---------GRo 

-- 
please notify andrew.parsons ~_._,_._._._ - -R- _ _ _ 

-..._._ 
as soon as possible and delete any copies. 

Unauthorised use, dissemination, distribution, publication or copying of this communication or attachments is prohibited and may be 
unlawful.<br /> 
Any files attached to this e-mail will have been checked by us with virus detection software before transmission. Bond Dickinson 
LLP accepts no liability for any loss or damage which may be caused by software viruses and you should carry out your own virus 
checks before opening any attachment.<br /> 
Content of this email which does not relate to the official business of Bond Dickinson LLP, is neither given nor endorsed by it.<br /> 
This email is sent for and on behalf of Bond Dickinson LLP which is a limited liability partnership registered in England and Wales 
under number OC317661. Our registered office is St Ann's Wharf, 112 Quayside, Newcastle Upon Tyne, NE 1 3DX, where a list of 
members' names is open to inspection. We use the term partner to refer to a member of the LLP, or an employee or consultant who is 
of equivalent standing. Our VAT registration number is GB 123393627.<br /> 
Bond Dickinson LLP is authorised and regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authority. 
</font> 
</p> 


