
POL00044961 
POL00044961 

-----.-.---, 
!%= = Glenn Chester To: Zoe Topham/ee GRO 

cc:
16!03/2009 08:52 Subject: Fw: Astwood Bank 346246 B96 6AD 

Zoe 

Further to your e-mail of 14.03.09 regarding Mr Wilson, former Subpostmaster, Astwood Bank Post 
Office, to see the e-mail below please. Once I have received a response from Jarnail I will of course 
let you know. Many thanks. 

Kind Regards 

Glenn 

Glenn Chester 
Contract Manager 

Post Office Ltd — Network Directorate 
Post Office Ltd, Contract Support Team, Upper Floors, The Markets DMB, 6-16 New York Street, Leeds, LS2 70Z 

GRO._._._._., 
glenn.chester( GRO

Confidential Information: This e-mail message is for the sole use of the intended recipient (s) 
and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorised review, use, 
disclosure or distribution is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient, please contact me 
by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

----- Forwarded by Glenn Chester/e/POSTOFFICE on 16/03/2009 08:51 ----- 

"Glenn Chester To: Jarnail A Singh/ei ---------------------- 

15/03/2009 20:42 rF ° cc: Gary R Thomas/ef i Robin GR 
Lismore/e GRO ;._._._._. 

Subject: Fw: Astwobcf'E3ank ~lFti2~+6 f39i56N1J_._._._._._ 

Jarnail 

I recently wrote to Mr Julian Wilson, former Subpostmaster, Astwood Bank PO, seeking repayment of 
the outstanding amount of E28551.98p (the attached letter refers please). I have now received a reply 
from the solicitors acting on behalf of Mr Wilson (to see the letter in the e-mail below please) and they 
refer me to your good self. In view of the comments put forward in the letter can you please confirm 
that recovery of the outstanding debt is now being pursued through the courts? Many thanks. 

Astwood Bank . letter re. debt C6.03.09.doc 

Regards 

Glenn 

Glenn Chester 
Contract Manager 

Post Office Ltd — Network Directorate 
Post Office Ltd, Contract Support Team, Upper Floors, The Markets DMB, 6-16 New York Street, Leeds, LS2 7DZ 
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Confidential Information: This e-mail message is for the sole use of the intended recipient (s) 
and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorised review, use, 
disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact me 
by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

----- Forwarded by Glenn Chester/e/POSTOFFICE on 15/03/2009 20:33 -----

NSA Account Managed To: Glenn Chester/d GRO 
Sent by: David Nolan cc:

Subject: Astwood Bank 346246 B96 6AD 
13/03/2009 11:08 

Glenn 

The following letter has been received: 

Astwood.pdf 

I have filed it on the EFC 

Regards 

Dave 

David Nolan 
Network Field Support — Admin Team 
Post Office Ltd — Network 
c/o Manchester Mail Centre, First Floor, 77 Oldham Road, Manchester, M4 5AA 

_G.RO  or i._._.GR-_._._. 

GRO ? or GRO 
david.nolanC J  GRO

Save Faper,  Please DO NOT print this e-mail unless you really need tot 

Confidential Information: This e-mail message is for the sole use of the intended recipient (s) 
and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorised review, use, 
disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact me 
by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 


